JEA Awards Agenda
September 7, 2023
225 North Pearl St., Jacksonville, FL. 32202 - Hydrangea Room 1st Floor

Teams Meeting Info

Consent Agenda

‘The Chief Procurement Officer offers the following items for the JEA Awards Consent Agenda. Any item may be moved from the Consent Agenda to the Regular Agenda by a committee member asking that the item be considered scparately. All items on the Consent agenda have been approved by OGC, Budget and the Business Unit Vice President and Chief. The posting of this agenda serves as an official
notice of JEA's intended decision for all recommended actions for Formal Purchases as defined by Section 3-101 of the JEA Procurement Code. Please refer to JEA's Procurement Code, if you wish to protest any of these items.

Solicitation # & Short Original Award JSEB Participation
Award # Type of Award . . vp Awardee Funding Source Award Amount e New Not-to-Exceed Amendments Term (Y/N) If Y, then list
Description/Title Amount
company name(s)
1 Minutes Minutes from 08/24/2023 Meeting N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
Request for Proposal| 1411282646 - Power Transformer Prolec - GE Waukesha, Inc. . $9,452,929.00 :
(RFP) Supply Agreements Melendez Hitachi Energy USA, Inc. Capital $9,980,800.00 NA NA
Advertised: 06/02/2023
Bid Opening: 08/01/2023
Two (2) Proposals Received
For additional information contact: Rodney Lovgren
The purpose of this Request for Proposal (the "RFP") s to contract multiple Power Transformer Manufactuers for a forward looking, 7+ year plan to support replacements and expansion projects, with reservations for production slots to ensure supply. JEA evaluated
5 the companies based on price and experience. Prolect GE Waukesha, Inc. and Hitachi Energy USA, Inc. were deemed highest evaluated & the lowest priced responsive and responsible proposers. NA Seven (7) Years, w/ Two (2) - 1 Yr. N
Renewals
The transformer prices in this bid are trending to follow the Large Specialty Transformer producer price index. This PPI for transformers when this scope of supply was last bid in Oct. 2017 was - 236.7 vs. July 2023 PP is 429.6 (81% increase), which is reflected in
the pricing received. Given the current market conditions is deemed reasonable. Additionally, with lead times ranging from 27 - 44 months.
GE Prolec as the lowest priced provider on the power transformers was is able to provide 5 of the 7 Power Transformers required in 2026. JEA elected to award the other 2 transformers to Hitachi Energy, to support project lead times, as their lead time supports the
2026 need.
All contracts will have a price adjustment methodology, which allows price adjustment through manufacturing release, or typically around 6 months prior to shipment.
There are currently 37 power transformer slots forecast for these contracts, which will be brought back to the awards committee periodically to fund the additional slotted transformer projects in the later years of the contract as budgets allow.
Request for Proposal| 1411316246 - Auto Transformer PTI Transformer LP . $3,667,500.00
(RFP) Supply Agreements Melendez Prolec GE Waukesha, Inc. Capital $0.00 NiA NA
Advertised: 06/02/2023
Bid Opening: 08/01/2023
Three (3) Proposals Received
For additional information contact: Rodney Lovgren
s The purpose of the Request for Proposal (the "RFP") is to contract two Auto transformer manufactuers for a forward looking, 7+ year plan to support replacements and expansion projects, with reservations for production slots to ensure supply. The longer term NA Seven (7) Years, w/ Two (2) - 1 Yr. N
contract s required as substation transformer lead times are 3+ years. JEA evaluated the companies based on price and experience. PTI transformers LP and Prolec GE Waukesha, Inc. were deemed the highest evaluated and lowest priced responsive and responsible Renewals
proposers.
The transformer prices in this bid are trending to follow the Large Specialty Transformer producer price index. This PPI for transformers when this scope of supply was last bid in Oct. 2017 was - 236.7 vs. July 2023 PP is 429.6 (81% increase), which is reflected in
the pricing received. Given the current market conditions is deemed reasonable.
Contracts have a price adjustment, which allows price adjustment through manufacturing release, or typically around 6 months prior to shipment. The Prolec GE contract is currently being awarded with a zero dollar value, as the prospective project need date for the
transformer where Prolec GE is lower priced forecast in 2032.
There are 6 Auto Transformer slots forecast for these contracts. These contracts will be brought back to the awards committee periodically to fund the additional slotted transformer projects in the later years of the contract as budgets and funds allow.
Information for Bid | 1411304846 - Small Diameter Pipe
QFB) Replacement Program - Forbes St. Vu United Brothers Development Corp Capital $4,521,559.60 N/A $4,521,559.60
Area Packages B and C Legacy Engincering
$8,000.00
DJ Contracting Inc.
$135,000.00
Advertised: 07/06/2023 ) Project Completion (estimated September | D & J Erosion Control
4 Bid Opening: 08/22/2023 N/A 24) Services $15,000.00
Four (4) Bids Received RZ Service Group LLC
For additional information contact: David King $240,926.00
Total ISEB Value
The Contractor will perform installation of 6,617 linear feet of various size water main: approximately 2,707 LF of 8" water main, 2,847 LF of 6” water main, and 736 LF of 4” water main, and 327 LF of 2" HDPE water main with associated fittings and $398.926.00
appurtenances. This will replace an existing water distribution system at the end of its useful life. The distribution system serves 142 residential and commercial parcels within the limits of a City of Jacksonville Ash Site known as the Forest Street Incinerator Site. Ash
from refuse incineration was placed in this area prior to the construction of the community.
Emergency - Buckman Biosolids - . . g
Emergency Class B Sudge Cake Hauling Vu Synagro South, LLC Capital $752,491.96 N/A $752,491.96
5 Project start: January 2023 N/A Project Completion (estimated August 2023) 0

For additional information contact: Darriel Brown

This emergency purchase was for the hauling and removal of Class B sludge cake to completely remove the stockpile at Buckman Water Reclamation Facility. After the removal of the stockpile, services were needed to continuously haul away the daily biosolids that
'were produced. Both the stockpile and daily production of biosolids were due to the Biosolids Dryer being out of service and being rebuilt.

Synagro was chosen due to their additional hauling capacity compared to the currently contracted vendors, extra locations for disposal of sludge cake, and immediate availability to address the emergency.




Solicitation # & Short Original Award

Amendments

Term

JSEB Participation
(Y/N) If Y, then list

Award # Type of Award . . VP Awardee Funding Source Award Amount New Not-to-Exceed
Description/Title Amount
name(s)
Information for Bid 1411319046 - FY24
m ""“‘(‘IF";‘) T PIC | Water/Wastewater Purchase of Fixed | Melendez | Thompson Pump & Mfg., Co. Inc. Capital $980,883.00 N/A $980,883.00
Diesel Pumps for Storm Resiliency
Advertised: 06/22/2023
Opened: 08/08/2023 ) .
6 Two (2) Bids Received N/A Project Completion (Expected: July 2024) N/A
For additional information contact: Dan Kruck
The scope of work for this contract is the supply of eleven diesel engine driven, self-contained automatic standby pony pump systems authorized by JEA Standards. JEA has three approved vendors for pony pumps, and one vendor informed JEA they would not be
participating in this bid prior to the advertisement.
The solicitation was advertised for twelve (12) pony pumps, and Thompson Pumps was low bidder for eleven of the required pumps. The other pump will be awarded informally to the other vendor (Xylem).
) . Briggs Equipment $94,177.96
Req"es:é‘:l,l;mpm' mlz“?l"'fele's'x;fd}fr: and Aerial| 1 Eiroy Leppo, Inc. FY24 Capital Purchase $483,210.00 NA $663,382.96
atiorm Soficitation Southern States Toyota Lift $85,995.00
Advertised: 06/12/2023
Optional Pre-bid: 06/20/2023
Responses Opened 07/25/2023, Four (4) Responses Opened
For additional Information Contact: Eddie Bayouth One-time purchase, Expected delivery
7 NA N
03/31/2024
This Request for Proposal (REP) is for the purchase of four (4) Class 364 Forklift Telehandlers (5500, 7000, 9000, 12000 LB) and one (1) Class 371 51' Aerial Platform for FY24. Two (2) of the Telehandlers and the Aerial Platform are for Electric replacement, one
(1) of the remaining Telehandlers is for Water replacement, and the other is for Water Expansion. All five (5) pieces of equipment will arrive in FY24.
JEA evaluated the proposals based on pricing (50%), form, fit and functionality to JEA requirements (15%), warranty (5%), safety features (10%), and ease of doing business (10%). The vendor with the highest evaluation for each items was selected.
Only two (2) of the telehandlers, the 5500 LBS and the 7000 LBS, have been purchased recently (FY22). The price increases for these two (2) telehandlers were 13.9% and 3.9%, which are lower than the increases we have seen the last two (2) years and deemed
reasonable. Based on the price increases Fleet has forecasted for the cost of vehicles, the estimates were higher than the actual costs.
Contract Increase | 27717 B“”"'““l','rfj'::fs"d’ Conversion| 1 lendez Carollo Engineers, Inc. Capital $4,942,828.06 $5,679,431.64 $20,442,279.52
C&ES Consultants Inc.
Last Awarded: 03/02/2023 04/21/2020 - (8333,197.00) (Inspection, Architectural
For additional information contact: Dan Kruck 08/24/2020 - $653,483.00 Services) $788,760.00
10/21/2020 - 60,212.00
The scope of work for this contract includes additional design and construction inspection of multiple treatment and infrastructure projects at the Buckman WRF. 04/22/2021 - $7,053,403.28 Mittauer & Associates
8 10/14/2021 - $209,989.00 Project Completion (Expected: May 2027) | Inc. (Yard Piping) -
This increase will add funds to the contract for additional engineering and design services underway for the thermal drum drying system, emergency cake loading silo, waste pellet silo, ferric chloride storage system, muriatic acid storage, and yard piping improvements. 04/07/2022 - $989,893.30 $441.200.00
The increase will also add funds for additional permitting support and additional construction phase services. 07/12/2022 - $52,646.00
08/18/2022 - $46,883.00 GM Hill Engineering Inc.
The biosolids upgrade at Buckman will be completed in 2027 and will then receive and process all biosolids material from other JEA facilities. In the interim, the existing Buckman biosolids facility is being rehabilitated to ensure production can continue until the new 03/02/2023 - $1,086,707.24 (Structural Eng) -
facility is completed. This will prevent the need to haul biosolids material which costs about $2M/month. The interim rehabilitation project is scheduled to be completed in September 2023. $41,000.00
The proposal was reviewed by JEA project staff and deemed reasonable when compared to other projects. The hourly rates used to develop the fee are fixed through the completion of the contract. The awardee has confirmed that this will be the last increase needed to
complete the design and services during construction for this contract.
Consent Agenda Action
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JEA Awards Agenda
August 24, 2023

225 North Pearl St., Jacksonville, FL. 32202 - Hydrangea Room 1st Floor

Teams Meeting Info

Consent Agenda

The Chief Procurement Officer offers the following items for the JEA Awards Consent Agenda. Any item may be moved from the Consent Agenda to the Regular Agenda by a committee member asking that the item be considered separately. Al items on the Consent agenda have been approved by OGC, Budget and the Business Unit Vice President and Chief. The posting of this agenda serves as an official
notice of JEA's intended decision for all recommended actions for Formal Purchases as defined by Section 3-101 of the JEA Procurement Code. Please refer to JEA's Procurement Code, if you wish to protest any of these items.

JSEB Participation
Solicitation # & Short . Original Award Y/N) If Y, then list
Award # Type of Award L . VP Awardee Funding Source Award Amount s New Not-to-Exceed Amendments Term YN
Description/Title Amount company name(s)
(%, $ - awarded)
1 Minutes Minutes from 08/17/2023 Meeting N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
Contract : : N
102-19 Bulk Ferric Chloride Supply Vu PVS Technologies, Inc. 0&M $797,936.17 $1,242,460.00 $3,682,163.18
Increase/Renewal
Last Awarded 05/04/2023
For Additional Information Contact: Darriel Brown
Three (3) Years w/Two (2) - | Yr. Renewals
The scope of work for this service for the supply and delivery of Ferric Chloride (FeCI3) and/or Ferric Sulfate (Fe2(SO4)3) which is used for struvite control in our wastewater treatment process. This product is to be delivered in a bulk shipment via tanker to JEA 0/30/2021 - $983.708.49 hree (3) o 1‘;;’0(1 /;019 o Renewals
2 Buckman Residuals Management Facilty. 3/16/2023 - $222,616.84 End: 10/31/2024 N/A
’ ) - ; : 5/412023 - $435.441.68
The current price of $2.58 per gallon was accepted for the first renewal term (through 10/31/2023). For this last renewal term (through 10/31/2024), the vendor requested an increase of 10% to $2.84 per gallon, citing increase in the global and domestic chlorine No Renewals Remaining
markets. The following benchmark pricing from other municipalities was compared to ensure competitive pricing for JEA: o
St. Petersburg, FL - $2.93/gal
Tampa, FL - $2.88/gal.
The Award amount was calculated by using the average spend for the past two years, factoring in the new price, and projecting the amount needed to cover through the end of the renewal term; no increase in usage is anticipated.
Piggyback, ServiceNow Licenses,
Support, and Analytics for
Change Order ServiceNow Help Desk Services Datz Carahsoft Technology Corporation O&M and Capital $184,460.64 $1,631,005.14 $1,849,414.50
Ticketing System, Discovery Module,
and Strategic Portfolio Management
Last Awarded: 08/29/2019 )
For additonal informaiton contact: Nathan Woyak Five (5) Years w/ no renewals
3 Piggyback of 43230000-NASPO-16-ACS, Carahsoft AR2472 08/19/2021- $33,948.72 Start Date: 08/30/2019 No
End Date: 08/29/2024
The current JEA Help Desk Service ticketing system using the ServiceNow (SN) Suite and P ance Analytics is an Inf Library (ITIL)-based IT (SN) Service Management (ITSM) Solution. This system gives JEA a
powerful platform for all ITIL processes. Service Desk Manager is used by CIP Compliance, Bulk Power Systems, Project Design, Security Fire & Corporate Records Compliance, Business Analysis, and Technology Services for ticket tracking, reporting, Change
Management, CIP Auditing, Availability, Reliability, and monthly SLA management metrics. The ServiceNow (SN) Discovery module has also replaced InformationTechnology Asset Management ITAM database.
This change order request is for $184,460.64 in additonal funds through the end of the original term on 08/20/2024. JEA has experienced organic growth from JEA growing and requiring more licenses over the previous and final year of the contract which accounts for
$11,316.24 in higher than expected O&M renewal cost. The additonal $173,144.40 is new capital being requested for JEA now expanding the ServiceNow platform to include Strategic Portfolio Management (SPM) module. This includes ITSM Pro (Upgrade from
ITSM Standard) & Increase ITSM ITIL User Licenses and Strategic Portfolio Management Professional. The Strategic Project module provides robust project portfolio management capabilities, allowing TS to prioritize, track, and manage JEA projects effectively. It
offers features like project prioritization, resource allocation, budgeting, and forecasting, enabling better strategic decision-making. The cost remains under the competitive rates of the NASPO contract.
N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
4 N/A N/A N/A
DEFERRED
R"‘“;::’;:is‘“gle FY23 Derrick Digger Purchase McElroy Global Rental Company, Inc. Capital $467,540.00 NA $467,540.00
For additional information contact: Eddie Bayouth
This Single Source/Ratification is for the purchase of two (2) 47 Derrick Diggers for FY23 JEA’s fleet capital for for the Electric Global Rental Company, Inc. contacted JEA Fleet with immediate availability of these two (2)
5 trucks based on requests from JEA to explore shortened lead-time aerial equipment. JEA previously moved in the direction of buying 50" derrick diggers to support the business because of heavier materials. However, 50° derrick diggers are custom trucks and currently NA One-time purchase, Equipment has been N
delivered.

have a lead time of 67-70 months at the time of order.

In April of this year, JEA purchased a similar derrick digger that Fleet had been renting for the past three (3) years. The listed price of the three year old truck was $180,772.00. The cost of each of these new derrick diggers is $233,770.00. The difference between
the budgeted amount and the actual cost is driven mainly by the fact that these are stock units, regular cab chassis vs extended cab, and the derrick is 47" instead of 50". These trucks will be upfitted by Altec to meet the JEA specifications. In light of the fact that the
vehicles allow JEA to receive assets several model years earlier than alternative custom truck designs, it allows JEA to retire aging assets and rental units instead of incurring unplanned costs. It should be noted JEA will buy custom longer lead-time assets as well, but is
able to find a strong mix of stock and custom units that balance business needs in many ways.

This is a full ratification as order was placed prior to awards committee approval to guarantee the availability of the trucks for JEA.




JSEB Participation
Solicitation # & Short . Original Award Y/N) If Y, then list
Award # Type of Award L . VP Awardee Funding Source Award Amount e New Not-to-Exceed Amendments Term ¥
Description/Title Amount company name(s)
(%, $ - awarded)
Ratification/Piggyback FY23 Vacuum Truck Purchase McElroy Environmental Products Group, Inc. Capital $325,595.55 NA $325,595.55
Piggyback Agency: Sourcewell
Contract # 101221-VTR 2100C-3 with Vactor Manufacturing
6 Contract Term: Start Date 11/30/2020, Five (5) Years w/ One (1) - 1 Yr. Renewal NA One-time purchase, Equipment has been N
For additional information contact: Eddie Bayouth delivered.
This Piggyback/Ratification is for the purchase of a Vactor Impact Vacuum truck for FY23 JEA’s fleet capital for for the Water In late May of this year, Environmental Products Group, Inc. (EPG) contacted JEA Fleet and
informed them of the immediate availability of a stock unit Vactor Impact Vacuum Truck. In order to ensure that JEA could get the vehicle, an order was placed with EPG. JEA Fleet had placed an order for three (3) vacuum truck in February of 2023 with an expected
delivery date of March 2024. Because of the immediate availability of this truck, JEA Fleet will be able to bridge the gap and avoid lengthy repairs on the older trucks, eliminating the need to rent a unit until the other three (3) trucks arrive in March of 2024.  Since
this is a stock unit, it does not have all of the options in the JEA specifications, so the price is lower than price quoted in January. JEA deems the price justifiable since it is comparable with the price paid earlier in the year for the custom units. This is a full ratification
and the unit has already been received.
Contract Increase/ | - 1410464046 ITN JEA Aerial Duty | - oy Altec Industries Capital $7,789,186.31 $2,854,202.00 $10,643,388.31
Ratification Vehicle Procurement
Original Award: 02/03/2022
For additional information contact: Eddie Bayouth
o R i One-time purchase, Expected Delivery
7 The majority of the contract increase amount for this award, $7,670,240.00, consists of the purchase of nineteen (19) custom bucket trucks and derrick diggers, six (6) of which will have an early scheduled delivery. The other thirteen (13) trucks have an average lead NA 06/30/2029 for Custom Units and N
time of between 58-70 months. Because of the long lead times, and the many uncertainties associated with such lead times, Altec's pricing is the anticipated cost once they are built. Their current estimated prices for FY28 are currently between 35% and 80% higher 06/30/2024 for Stock Units
than the prices JEA paid for this equipment in FY2021. Based on projected replacements in FY28 - FY29 and in order to secure manufacturing slots to meet Fleet's capital requirements for aerial equipment, orders must be placed now. N
The Ratification amount of $1,507,284.00 is for the six (6) 55" bucket trucks already ordered and mentioned above. These trucks were in the custom production queue at Altec's manufacturing facility in the process of becoming material handling trucks when the
original customer cancelled the order. Altec notified JEA that the trucks could easily be converted to bucket trucks if JEA elected to purchase them. In order to secure their availability, JEA issued a BPA to Altec in June. The trucks will be available by 06/30/2024,
well in advance of the current 58-70 month lead time for custom orders.
The second and much smaller portion of the contract increase, $118,946.31, is for the upfitting of three (3) Altec 47 stock derrick diggers purchased from Global Rental Company, Altec's rental unit division. Two (2) of the trucks were in the ratification above and the
third was a rental unit purchased in April of this year. In order to ensure consistency in the upfits to meet JEA's technical specifications and for warranty purposes, JEA has elected to have the outfitting completed by Altec, the equipment manufacturer.
040-19 Greenland Water Reclamation
) Facility (WRF) Pipelines: Water, 5 .
Contract Increase Reclaimed Water and Sanitary Sewer Melendez Garney Companies, Inc. Capital $932,386.00 $3,605,160.00 $61,375,355.46 11/01/2019 - $45,720.00
Force Mains 03/02/2020 - $110,579.00
04/22/2020 - $40,441.00
09/28/2020 - $112,973.53
Last Awarded: 02/09/2023 11/16/2020 - $10,500.00
8 For additional information contact: Dan Kruck 04/08/2021 - $21,039.60 Project Completion (Expected: April 2024) N/A
09/02/2021 - $476,782.00
The scope of work for this contract includes design, pre-construction services and construction of water, reclaimed water and sanitary sewer forcemains. These lines will convey water to and from the new Greenland WREF to the rest of the JEA water and wastewater 12/09/2021 - $6,156,627.77
system. 02/17/2022 - $43,376,077.17
11/17/2022 - $3,635,894.97
JEA planning identified an urgent need for a booster pump station to redirect flow from the Blacks Ford WRF to the Mandarin WRF until the Greenland WRF is completed. The proposed booster pump station is within this contract project area, and by having this 02/09/2023 - $2,851,174.42
vendor build the station JEA will avoid serious flow issues and construction coordination and delay issues. This increase includes the design of the booster pump station and the development of the guaranteed maximum price (GMP). After a GMP is negotiated and
agreed upon, another contract increase will be brought before the Awards Committee. The proposal was compared to recent projects and deemed reasonable.
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Award #2 09/07/2023 Supporting Documentation

Capitalor | o\ | cp Number FY24 FY25 FY26 FY27

0&M

Capital | 8008808 | 788-190 | S 635060.00 | S 952,590.00 | S 1,587,650.00 3,175,300.00
Capital | 8008810 | 788-104 | $ 337,727.60 | $ 67545520 | S 2,364,093.20 3,377,276.00
Capital | 8008806 | 788-176 | $ 155,012.90 | $ = [ 1,395,116.10 1,550,129.00
Capital | 8008807 | 788-177 | $ 155,012.90 | $ ~ [$  310,025.80 | $ 1,085,090.30 1,550,129.00
Capital | 8008809 | 788-106 | $ 915,800.00 | $ 1,373,700.00 | S 2,289,500.00 4,579,000.00
Capital | 8008826 | 788-181 | $ 1,113,250.00 | $ ~ [$ 1,113,250.00 2,226,500.00
Capital | 8008805 | 788-179 | $ 149,006.00 S 1,341,054.00 1,490,060.00
Capital TBD | 788191 | $ ~ s 14853350 % 1,336,801.50 1,485,335.00

niununnnnnnnnnlniniunin

Award Totals

S 3,460,869.40

$ 3,150,278.70

$ 11,737,490.60

$ 1,085,090.30

$ 19,433,729.0

Awardee

Hitachi
GE Prolec
GE Prolec
GE Prolec

Hitachi

Hitachi
GE Prolec
GE Prolec

GE Prolec

Date Event Tracking Amount
8/31/2023| Original Award | S 9,452,929.00

10% increase | $ -

New NTE S -

This Increase | $ -

New NTE S -

Hitachi

Date Event Tracking Amount
8/31/2023| Original Award | S 9,980,800.00

10% increase | $ -

New NTE S -

This Increase | $ -

New NTE S -




Award #2 09/07/2023 Supporting Documentation

1411282646 Power Transformers Evaluation Summary

Total Evaluated P | Pri
Vendor Rankings Aldajuste Szoke ROH b1 Rank ot valuate . roposa r_'ce
Score Price Points
GE Prolec - 44 month lead time 99.0 100.0 95.0 294 1 98.0 $62,791,554 70.0
Hitachi - 27 month lead time 73.1 70.1 67.1 210 2 70.1 $97,526,300 45.1
Aldajuste Quotation of Rates Experi?nce (30 Total Rank
(70) Points)
GE Prolec - 44 month lead time 70.0 29.0 99.0 1
Hitachi - 27 month lead time 45.1 28.0 73.1 2
Szoke Quotation of Rates Experu.ence (30 Total Rank
(70) Points)
GE Prolec - 44 month lead time 70.0 30.0 100.0 1
Hitachi - 27 month lead time 45.1 25 70.1 2
ROH Quotation of Rates Experu.ence (30 Total Rank
(70) Points)
GE Prolec - 44 month lead time 70.0 25.0 95.0 1
Hitachi - 27 month lead time 45.1 22.0 67.1 2
Quotation of Rates Experience (30
Overall Averages Total
& (70) Points) o
GE Prolec - 44 month lead time 0.00

Hitachi - 27 month lead time

0.00




Award #2 09/07/2023 Supporting Documentation

Power Transformers

HITACH]I, Crystal Springs, MS, South Boston, VA

Transformer Description (see L . . . —_—
# . e . Forecast Unit Price Evaluated Price Unit Price Evaluated Price unit price delta
technical specifications)
1 230 kV Delta to 27kV WYE 10 $ 3,175,300.00 $34,147,000 | S  1,688,638.00 $1,919,538 [ $ 1,486,662.00
2 138 kV Delta to 27kV WYE 10 S 2,289,500.00 $24,955,000 | $  1,550,129.00 $1,752,779 | $§ 739,371.00
3 69 kV Delta to 27kV WYE 4 S 2,226,500.00 $9,714,000 | $  1,490,060.00 $1,683,610 [ $ 736,440.00
4 69 kV Delta to 13kV WYE 8 S 2,453,000.00 $21,289,200 | S  1,485,335.00 $1,682,835 [ $ 967,665.00
5 138 X 69 kV Delta to 27kV WYE 3
$ 2,272,100.00 $7,421,100 | $  1,757,638.00 $1,957,088 [ $ 514,462.00
$97,526,300 $62,791,554
45.1 70




Note: Substation Maintenance needs these transformers delivered in within the first 6 months of each calendar year.

GE Prolec Award 14,854,729.00 | Hitachi Award s 4,579,000.00
1411282646 Addendum 1 Power Substation Transformer Forecast Needs by Calendar Year
30/40/50 MVA Power Transformers - Project and Awardee information / unit pi Flow of Cash by FY by Spend
1 2 3 4 5 6 7 | RENEWAL|RENEWAL
Contract Year >
# Transformer Description Substation CVZSDI:::very cvvul:::“"’ Cv2026 | Cv2027 | cv2028 | €v2029 | Cv2030 | Cv2031 | c€v2032 @ ':L:"::r Base Unit Price Awardee FY2024 FY2025 FY2026 FY2027 Cross Check
1 230KV Delta to 27KV WYE Switzerland T1 1 GE Prolec PAYMENT TERMS & MILESTONES
230 kV Delta to 27KV WYE Point Meadows T2 1 788190 | 8008808| § 3,175,300.00 Hitachi $ 635,060.00 | § 952,590.00 1,587,650.00 $ 3,175,300.00 10% to be Involced upon Design Approval (not to exceed 2
2026 - Jul \weeks after release of drawing design)
230 KV Delta to 27kV WYE Etown 11812 2 20% o be invoiced upon Release to
230KV Delta to 27kV WYE New World T1 & 12 2026 -Jun 2 788104 | 8008810] § 1,688,638.00 GE Prolec s 337,727.60 | § 675,455.20 2,364,093.20 s 3,377,276.00 60% to be invoiced upon Shipment
230KV Delta t0 27KV WYE Vilages North T18. 12 5 % t0 be invoiced upon Final Acceptance by JEA (not o
exceed 30 days after delivery)
230KV Delta to 27kV WYE Durbin T1&T2 2
2 138 kV Delta to 27kV WYE Hartley T1 cv27-@2/a3 1 788176 | 8008806| $ 155012900 |  GEPROLEC27?  |$ 155,012.90 | § - 1,395,116.10 $ 1,550,129.00
25 138 kV Delta to 27kV WYE Hartley T2 cv27-@2/a3 1 788177 | 8008807| $ 155012900 |  GEPROLEC27?  |$ 155,012.90 | § - 31002580 [$  1,085,09030 | $ 1,550,129.00
138 kV Delta to 27kV WYE Blount Island T1 1
138 kV Delta to 27kV WYE Powers T1& T2 1 1
138 kV Delta to 27kV WYE San Pablo T1 1 Hitachi 2
138 KV Delta 0 27KV WYE i TL 8T 5 oAt Drawing Submission - 20 months prir to delivery
138 kV Delta to 27kV WYE Pecan Park T1 & T2 2026 - Jun 2 788106 | 8008809 $ 2,289,500.00 Hitachi $ 91580000 [$  1,373,700.00 2,289,500.00 $ 4,579,000.00 30% ) ;
At Release 8 months prior to delivery
3 69 kV Delta to 27kv WYE Merrill Rd T1 2026 - npr 1 788181 | 8008826 $ 2,226,500.00 Hitachi $ 44530000 | $ 667,950.00 1,113,250.00 s 2,226,500.00 0% ?:T:’ Factory Acceptance Testing 1 month prior to
69KV Delta to 27kV WYE Paxon T1 c27-2/03 1 788179 | 8008805| $ 149006000 |  GEPROLEC27? | $ 148,006.00 1,341,054.00 s 1,490,060.00 o |
ipment
69 KV Delta to 27kV WYE Northshore T1 1
69 KV Delta to 27kY WYE Grand Park T2 1
) 69 KV Delta to 13KV WYE Kennedy T12 (56 MVA) | 2026 -June 1 788191 | T80 |3 1,485,335.00 GE Prolec s 148,533.50 1,336,801.50 s 1,485,335.00
69 KV Delta to 13KV WYE Randall T3 1
69 KV Delta to 13k WYE Georgia St T1 1
69 KV Delta to 13kV WYE Water St T1 (Network] 1
69 KV Delta to 13k WYE College St T2 (Network] 1
69 KV Delta to 13KV WYE Church St T1 (Network) 1
69 KV Delta to 13k WYE College st T3 1
69 KV Delta to 13k WYE Georgia St T3 1
5 138X 69 KV Delta to 27kV WYE Spares 1 1 1
Subtotal o ) 7 7 7 3 4 4 3
P Project Nun FY2024 Fr2025 FY2026
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1411282646 Addendum 1 Power Transformer Supply Agreement (Power) (BIDDER SHALL FILL IN YELLOW CELLS)
G teed No-Load G teed Load L G teed Auxili Evaluated Unit
Lead Time in Transformer Description (see Unit Price (Base uaranteed To-.0a uaranteed 10ad 0sses uaranteed Auxitiary . valuated Uni Extended Evaluated
# ) L. . Price(Total Evaluated Forecast .
Months technical specifications) Price) kw Amount kw Amount kw Amount Bid Price) Price
1 27 230 kV Delta to 27kV WYE S 3,175,300.00 214 $5,000 129.4 $1,000 6 $500 $3,414,700 10 $34,147,000
2 27 138 kV Delta to 27kV WYE S 2,289,500.00 17.97 $5,000 113 $1,000 6.3 $500 $2,495,500 10 $24,955,000
3 27 69 kV Delta to 27kV WYE S 2,226,500.00 17.2 $5,000 113 $1,000 6 $500 $2,428,500 4 $9,714,000
4 27 69 kV Delta to 13kV WYE S 2,453,000.00 18.5 $5,000 112.5 $1,000 6.3 $500 $2,661,150 8 $21,289,200
5 27 138 X 69 kV Delta to 27kV WYE S 2,272,100.00 17.2 $5,000 112.8 $1,000 5.6 $500 $2,473,700 3 $7,421,100
Power Transformers Total Bid Price (This is the Total Evaluated Bid Price, Enter this Amount on Line 1 of the Bid Form) $97,526,300
MATERIALS AND SERVICE OPTIONS PRICING (BIDDER SHALL FILL IN YELLOW CELLS)
# Material / Service Option Description of Work Qty Unit Price
1 Field Serivce Technician 3 days of service during time period Monday - Friday, including travel and per diem. 1 Lot
14,500.00
2 Additional Optional Training 5 days of training, including travel, per diem 1 Lot
19,000.00
3 In and Out Costs Move in and out of Storage 1 Lot
See proposal
4 Storage Costs If Delivery delayed > 30 days from Ready to Ship. Delivery delays < 30 days shall be absorbed by Per Month
the Company see proposal
5 Critical Spare Parts
TBD
6 Critical Spare Parts
7 Critical Spare Parts




Award #2 09/07/2023 Supporting Documentation

1411282646 Addendum 1 Power Transformer Supply Agreement (Power) (BIDDER SHALL FILL IN YELLOW CELLS)
Lead Time in Transformer Description (see Unit Price (Base Guaranteed No-Load Guaranteed Load Losses Guaranteed Auxiliary _ Evaluated Unit Extended Evaluated
# . e L. . Price(Total Evaluated Forecast .
Months technical specifications) Price) kw Amount kw Amount kw Amount Bid Price) Price
1 40 230 kV Delta to 27kV WYE S 1,688,638.00 22 $5,000 116 $1,000 9.8 $500 $1,919,538 10 $19,195,380
2 40 138 kV Delta to 27kV WYE S 1,550,129.00 20.5 $5,000 95 $1,000 10.3 $500 $1,752,779 10 $17,527,790
3 40 69 kV Delta to 27kV WYE S 1,490,060.00 17 $5,000 103 $1,000 11.1 $500 $1,683,610 4 $6,734,440
4 40 69 kV Delta to 13kV WYE S 1,485,335.00 16.7 $5,000 109.6 $1,000 8.8 $500 $1,682,835 8 $13,462,680
5 40 138 X 69 kV Delta to 27kV WYE S 1,757,638.00 18.2 $5,000 104.2 $1,000 8.5 $500 $1,957,088 3 $5,871,264
Power Transformers Total Bid Price (This is the Total Evaluated Bid Price, Enter this Amount on Line 1 of the Bid Form) $62,791,554
MATERIALS AND SERVICE OPTIONS PRICING (BIDDER SHALL FILL IN YELLOW CELLS)
# Material / Service Option Description of Work Qty Unit Price
1 Field Serivce Technician 3 days of service during time period Monday - Friday, including travel and per diem. 1 Lot
10,950.00
2 Additional Optional Training 5 days of training, including travel, per diem 1lot
10,870.00
3 In and Out Costs Move in and out of Storage 1 Lot
4 Storage Costs If Delivery delayed > 30 days from Ready to Ship. Delivery delays < 30 days shall be absorbed by per Month
the Company -
5 Critical Spare Parts One (1) HV bushing
8,536.00
6 Critical Spare Parts One (1) LV bushing
1,900.00
7 Critical Spare Parts
GE Prolec PAYMENT TERMS & MILESTONES
to be invoiced upon Design Approval
10% (not to exceed 2 weeks after release
of drawing design)
20% to be invoiced upon_ReIease to
Manufacturing
60% to be invoiced upon Shipment
to be invoiced upon Final Acceptance
10% by JEA (not to exceed 30 days after
delivery)

100%
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Award #3 09/07/2023 Supporting Documentation

Capital or O&M PN CP Number | FY23 FY24 FY25 FY26 FY27
Capital TBD 788-148 $  183,375.00|$ 18337500 | $  733,500.00 | $ 2,567,250.00 | $ 3,667,500.00
Award Totals $- |s 18337500|$ 183,375.00 | $  733,500.00 | $ 2,567,250.00 | $ 3,667,500.00

Awardee

PTI

PTI Transformers

Date

Event

Tracking Amount

8/31/2023

Original Award

3,667,500.00

10% increase

New NTE

This Increase

New NTE

wr|n|n]| v |n

GE Prolec

Date

Event

Tracking Amount

8/31/2023

Original Award

10% increase

New NTE

This Increase

New NTE

wr | v |n|n




Award #3 09/07/2023 Supporting Documentation

Auto Transformers

Vendor Rankings Aldajuste Szoke ROH 2 Rank Total Proposal Price Pr.lce
Score Points
PTI Transformers 42 Months 99.0 95.0 93.0 287 1 95.7 $24,818,600 70.0
GE Prolec - 44 months 90.2 90.2 86.2 267 2 88.9 $28,384,908 61.2
Hyundia - 44 - 28 72.7 70.7 68.7 212 3 70.7 $39,740,553 43.7
Aldajuste Quotation of Rates Experi'ence (30 Total Rank
(70) Points)
PTI Transformers 42 Months 70.0 29.0 99.0 1
GE Prolec - 44 months 61.2 29.0 90.2 2
Hyundia - 44 - 28 43.7 29.0 72.7 3
S70ke Quotation of Rates Experi'ence (30 Total Rank
(70) Points)
PTI Transformers 42 Months 70.0 25.0 95.0 1
GE Prolec - 44 months 61.2 29 90.2 2
Hyundia - 44 - 28 43.7 27.0 70.7 3
ROH Quotation of Rates Experi'ence (30 Total Rank
(70) Points)
PTI Transformers 42 Months 70.0 23.0 93.0 1
GE Prolec - 44 months 61.2 25.0 86.2 2
Hyundia - 44 - 28 43.7 25.0 68.7 3




Award #3 09/07/2023 Supporting Documentation

Auto Transformers Hyundai - AL PTI Transformers - Ont. Canada GE PROLEC WAUKESHA - WAUKESHA, WI
T f D ipti Lead Ti il Lead Ti i Lead Ti il
rans or.mer es?r.|p |.on (see Forecast eac fime in Unit Price Evaluated Price €ac fime in Unit Price Evaluated Price eac fime in Unit Price Evaluated Price UP Delta
technical specifications) Months Months Months
Normandy T6 - 400 MVA, 5%Z, CY 2028 42 months
230KV WYE to 138KV WYE 1 S 6,756,297.00 $7,230,297 after ARO 4,337,100.00 $4,797,100 44-46 S 5,187,868.00 $5,656,668 $  850,768.00
West Jax T2 - 300MVA, 6%Z, CY 2028 42 months
230KV WYE to 69KV WYE 1 S 6,780,260.00 $7,368,260 after ARO 4,220,200.00 $4,806,700 44-46 S 4,653,968.00 $5,279,868 S 433,768.00
Mayo T6 - 300MVA, 5%Z, 230kV By 6/30/2027 42 months
WVYE to 138KV WYE 1 $ 5,799,135.00 $6,195,135 after ARO 3,667,500.00 $4,051,500 44-46 S 4,602,268.00 $4,996,368 S 934,768.00
Robinwood T6 - 200 MVA, 5% Z, first half of 42 months
230KV WYE to 138KV WYE 1 2028 S 5,184,979.00 $5,526,979 after ARO 3,183,600.00 $3,467,600 44-46 S 3,537,268.00 $3,863,568 $  353,668.00
Greenland T6 - 300 MVA, 5%Z, first half of 42 months
230KV WYE to 138KV WYE 1 2030 S 6,854,665.00 $7,250,665 after ARO 3,667,500.00 $4,051,500 44-46 S 4,602,268.00 $4,996,368 S  934,768.00
first half of 42 months
Robinwood T4 - 200 MVA, 5%Z, 1 2032 $ 5,802,217.00 $6,169,217 after ARO 3,322,700.00 $3,644,200 44-46 S 3,253,968.00 | $ 3,592,068.00 | $ (68,732.00)
138kV WYE to 69kV WYE. No LTC
$39,740,553 $24,818,600 $28,384,908
43.7 70 61.2




Award #3 09/07/2023 Supporting Documentation

Note: Substation Maintenance needs these transformers delivered in within the first 6 months of each calendar year. PTI Award $ 3,667,500.00 | GE Prolec
1411316246 Substation Transformer Forecast Forecast i . ) o
Project and Awardee information / unit prices Flow of Cash by FY by Spend
Auto Transformers
Substation [ CY cy cy cy cy cy cy cy cy Project
ipti i j it Pri [ t Schedul
# AutoTransformer Description Substation | Projects Maint 2024 | 2025 | 2026 | 2027 | 2028 | 2029 | 2030 | 2031 | 2032 cP Number Base Unit Price Awardee FY2024 FY2025 FY2026 FY2027 Cross Check ayment Schedule

Normandy T6 - 400 MVA, 5%Z, .

230KV WYE to 138KV WYE Normandy 1 1 $  4,337,100.00 | PTI Transformers. 5% |Design Approval

West Jax T2 - 300MVA, 6%Z, 230kV N
WYE to 68KV WYE West Jax 1 1 $  4,220,200.00 | PTITransformers 5% |Net 30 days after Design approval
Mayo T6 - 300MVA, 5%Z, 230KV Mayo 1 1 $  3,667,500.00 | PTITransformers |$ 183,375.00 | $ 183,375.00 | $  733,500.00 | $ 2,567,250.00 | $ 3,667,500.00 | 20% |30 days at time of Manufacturing release
WYE to 138kV WYE

Robinwood T6 - 200 MVA, 5% Z, N

230kV WYE to 138KV WYE Robinwood 1 1 $ 3,183,600.00 PTI Transformers 40% |Net 30 days at time of successful FAT

Greenland T6 - 300 MVA, 5%Z, " N

230KV WYE to 138KV WYE Greenland 1 1 $  3,667,500.00 | PTITransformers 20% |Net 30 days upon delivery to site
Robinwood T4 - 200 MVA, 5%Z, . Payment after the final acceptance, but not
138KV WYE to 69KV WYE. No LTC | RoPinwood 1 2 $  3253,968.00 GE Prolect 10% |16 exceed 30 days after delivery.

Subtotal 3 3 0 0 0 1 3 0 1 0 1
Subtotal
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1411316246 Transformer Supply Agreement (Auto) (BIDDER SHALL FILL IN YELLOW CELLS)
Guaranteed No-Load Guaranteed Load Losses Guaranteed Auxiliary 5
L . . Evaluated Unit
Lead Time in Transformer Description (see Unit Price (Base Losses (Note 4) Losses . Extended Evaluated
# . . A Price(Total Evaluated Forecast .
Months technical specifications) Price) o Price
kw Amount kw Amount kw Amount Bid Price)
42 months after Normandy T6 - 400 MVA, 5%Z,
1 e 230KV WYE to 138KV WYE $ 4,337,100.00 a4 $5,000 233 $1,000 14 $500 $4,797,100 1 $4,797,100
42 months after West Jax T2 - 300MVA, 6%Z, 230kV
2 ARO WYE to 69KV WYE 5 AZAATIED| 5B $5000 | 2915 $1,000| 10 $500 $4,806,700 1 $4,806,700
42 months after Mayo T6 - 300MVA, 5%Z, 230kV WYE
3 e to 138KV WYE S 3,667,500.00 36 $5,000 197 $1,000 14 $500 $4,051,500 1 $4,051,500
42 months after |[Robinwood T6 - 200 MVA, 5% Z, 230kV
4 e WYE to 138KV WYE S 3,183,600.00 28 $5,000 139 $1,000 10 $500 $3,467,600 1 $3,467,600
42 months after Greenland T6 - 300 MVA, 5%Z, 230kV
5 e WYE to 138KV WYE $ 3,667,500.00 36 $5,000 197 $1,000 14 $500 $4,051,500 1 $4,051,500
42 months after |[Robinwood T4 - 200 MVA, 5%Z, 138kV
6 e WYE to 69KV WYE. No LTC S 3,322,700.00 30 $5,000 167 $1,000 9 $500 $3,644,200 1 $3,644,200
Auto Transformers Total Bid Price (This is the Total Evaluated Bid Price, Enter this Amount on Line 2 of the Bid Form) $24,818,600
MATERIALS AND SERVICE OPTIONS PRICING (BIDDER SHALL FILL IN YELLOW CELLS)
# Material / Service Option Description of Work Qty Unit Price
1 Field Service Technician 3 days of service during time period Monday - Friday, including travel and per diem. 1 Lot 18,500.00
2 Additional Optional Training 5 days of training, including travel, per diem 1 Lot 17,000.00
3 In and Out Costs Move in and out of Storage 1 Lot Note 3
4 Storage Costs If Delivery delayed > 30 days from Ready to Ship. Delivery delays < 30 days shall be absorbed by the per Month Note 3
Company
5 Critical Spare Parts Normandy T6 (HV Bushing - 1 pc., LV Bushing - 1 pc., Neutral Bushing - 1 pc., Gaskets - 1 set) 1 Set 37,000.00
6 Critical Spare Parts West Jax T2 (HV Bushing - 1 pc., LV Bushing - 1 pc., Neutral Bushing - 1 pc., Gaskets - 1 set) 1 Set 35,000.00
7 Critical Spare Parts Mayo T6 (HV Bushing - 1 pc., LV Bushing - 1 pc., Neutral Bushing - 1 pc., Gaskets - 1 set) 1 Set 37,000.00
8 Critical Spare Parts Robinwood T6 (HV Bushing - 1 pc., LV Bushing - 1 pc., Neutral Bushing - 1 pc., Gaskets - 1 set) 1 Set 34,000.00
9 Critical Spare Parts Greenland T6 (HV Bushing - 1 pc., LV Bushing - 1 pc., Neutral Bushing - 1 pc., Gaskets - 1 set) 1 Set 37,000.00
10 Critical Spare Parts Robinwood T4 (HV Bushing - 1 pc., LV Bushing - 1 pc., Neutral Bushing - 1 pc., Gaskets - 1 set) 1 Set 28,500.00

Note 1: Assembly, Vacuum Oil Fill, Testing & Commissioning of Transformer at site is not inluded in the price and shall be extra if required.

Note 2: The Services regarding #1 (Field Service Technician) and #2 (Additional Optional Training) are given per 1 Unit (Autotransformer)

Note 3: Please refer to Storage and associated costs as shown in Section 1.8 of the Bid Proposal.

Note 4: The losses are given at rated voltage, frequency and at the self-cooled rating (ONAN).

Note 5: Unit Price (Base Price) is to be adjusted based on Section 1.4. of the Bid Proposal




Award #3 09/07/2023 Supporting Documentation

1411316246 Transformer Supply Agreement (Auto) (BIDDER SHALL FILL IN YELLOW CELLS)
G teed No-Load G teed Load L G teed Auxili Evaluated Unit
Lead Time in Transformer Description (see Unit Price (Base uaranteed Mo-~0a uaranteed L0ad L0sses yaranteed Auxiiary . valuated Lni Extended Evaluated
# . - . Price(Total Evaluated Forecast .
Months technical specifications) Price) kW Amount kW Amount kw Amount Bid Price) Price
Normandy T6 - 400 MVA, 5%Z,
1 44-46 months 230KV WYE to 138KV WYE S 5,187,868.00 55 $5,000 187.7 $1,000 12.2 $500 $5,656,668 1 $5,656,668
West Jax T2 - 300MVA, 6%Z, 230kV
2 44-46 months WYE to 69KV WYE S 4,653,968.00 77.8 $5,000 231 $1,000 11.8 $500 $5,279,868 1 $5,279,868
M T6 - 300MVA, 5%Z, 230kV WYE
3 | 44-46 months ave » S%Z, $  4,602,26800| 41 $5,000 183 $1,000 |  12.2 $500 $4,996,368 1 $4,996,368
to 138kV WYE
Robinwood T6 - 200 MVA, 5% Z, 230kV
4 44-46 months WVYE to 138KV WYE S 3,537,268.00 289 $5,000 175 $1,000 13.6 $500 $3,863,568 1 $3,863,568
Greenland T6 - 300 MVA, 5%Z, 230kV
5 42-44 th ! ’ 4,602,268.00 41 5,000 183 1,000 12.2 500 4,996,368 1 4,996,368
months WYE to 138KV WYE $ ,602, $5, 81, $ $4,996, $4,996,
Robinwood T4 - 200 MVA, 5%Z, 138kV
6 42-44 months WVYE to 69kV WYE. No LTC S 3,253,968.00 34 $5,000 162 $1,000 12.2 $500 $3,592,068 1 $3,592,068
Auto Transformers Total Bid Price (This is the Total Evaluated Bid Price, Enter this Amount on Line 2 of the Bid Form) $28,384,908
MATERIALS AND SERVICE OPTIONS PRICING (BIDDER SHALL FILL IN YELLOW CELLS)
# Material / Service Option Description of Work Qty Unit Price
1 Field Serivce Technician 3 days of service during time period Monday - Friday, including travel and per diem. 1 Lot
22,700.00
2 Additional Optional Training 5 days of training, including travel, per diem 1Llot
10,870.00
3 In and Out Costs Move in and out of Storage 1 Lot
4 Storage Costs If Delivery delayed > 30 days from Ready to Ship. Delivery delays < 30 days shall be absorbed by Per Month
the Company -
5 Critical Spare Parts One (1) HV bushing
10,335.00
6 Critical Spare Parts One (1) LV bushing
7,192.00
7 Critical Spare Parts
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Award #7 09/07/2023 Supporting Documentation

RFP 1411294846 TELEHANDLERS AND AERIAL PLATFORM BID ANALYSIS

Number of Lifts | Quoted Unit Price

HEIGHT / 25’ HORRIZONTAL REACH)

JEA Ttem ID  |Item Description uom
JEACLASS 364 |JEA CLASS 364 FORKLIFT TELEHANDLER 5,500 o
FORKLIFT L8 20 LIFT HEIGHT TELEHANDLER FORKLIFT | =3¢
JEACLASS 364 [JEA CLASS 364: 7,000 LB LIFT CAPACITY Each
FORKLIFT [ TELEHANDLER FORKLIFT
[JEA CLASS 364 [JEA CLASS 364: 9,000 LB LIFT CAPACITY Each
FORKLIFT [ TELEHANDLER FORKLIFT
cnanso [ e
FORKLIFT . ad

JEA CLASS 371 TELESCOPING MAN LIFT,
JEACLASS 371 |DIESEL ROUGH TERRAIN ARTICULATING /
I TELESCOPING TELESCOPING 4X4 MAN LIFT, (500 LB Each
MAN LIFT PLATFORM CAPACITY / 50’ PLATFORM

Lead Time:
In Calendar
Days After
Receipt of

Evaluatio
n Points

Lead Time:
In Calendar
Days After
Receipt of

Lead Time:

In Calendar Days | Price
After Receipt of

Order

Evaluation
Points

Lead Time:
In Calendar
Days After
Receipt of

Evaluation

Points Total Points

43.66] 89.27]

44.66] 86.27|




Award #7 09/07/2023 Supporting Documentation

Gallardo Denton  Lynn

Gallardo

Denton

Lynn Gallardo

Denton

Lynn

Gallardo

Denton

Lynn

Telehandlers and Aerial Platform Evaluation Vendor | Briggs Equipment

Leppo,

Inc | Ring Power Corporation |

Southern States Toyota Lift |

GROUP 1: CLASS 364 5500 LB FORKLIFT TELEHANDLER
Evaluation Criteria Total Points

Form, Fit and Functionality to JEA's Requirements:

Please describe how your proposed solution meets and does
not meet the technical specification submitted with this
solicitation. Please also provide information regarding your 15 15
proposed solution’s functionality and operational aspects may
and can provide value to JEA. Please fill out the below table for
each item you are submitting a bid.

Warranty:

Please provide information regarding your proposed solution’s
warranty and how JEA would be supported for warranty work if 5 4
your solution was awarded. If in excess of the specification,
please provide. 5 4
Safety Features:

Please provide information regarding your proposed solution’s
safety features from basic aspects through unique functionality
and the value it can provide to JEA. Please state those
features that are outside the specification.

10 10

Ease of Doing Business:

Please provide information regarding your post award plan to
perform to the agreement from communication plan, ease of 10 10
communication, ease of delivery, etc. that is included in your
proposal. 10 9
Proposed Delivery Date:

Please provide your anticipated delivery date along with how
this date is created relative to major components and labor.
Please also define any contingency plans to mitigate issues
along with any obligations you have of JEA to meet your
proposed plan. 7 7

10 8

10

13

10

10

7

10

50 45 47

13 20

16 40 18

)

37

47

)

40

Average 45|

I

L4

| 43.66667|




Award #7 09/07/2023 Supporting Documentation

Telehandlers and Aerial Platform Evaluation

GROUP 1: CLASS 364 7000 LB FORKLIFT TELEHANDLER
Evaluation Criteria

Form, Fit and Functionality to JEA's Requirements:

Please describe how your proposed solution meets and does
not meet the technical specification submitted with this
solicitation. Please also provide information regarding your
proposed solution’s functionality and operational aspects may
and can provide value to JEA. Please fill out the below table for
each item you are submitting a bid.

Warranty:

Please provide information regarding your proposed solution’s
warranty and how JEA would be supported for warranty work if
your solution was awarded. If in excess of the specification,
please provide.

Safety Features:

Please provide information regarding your proposed solution’s
safety features from basic aspects through unique functionality
and the value it can provide to JEA. Please state those
features that are outside the specification.

Ease of Doing Business:

Please provide information regarding your post award plan to
perform to the agreement from communication plan, ease of
communication, ease of delivery, etc. that is included in your
proposal.

Proposed Delivery Date:

Please provide your anticipated delivery date along with how
this date is created relative to major components and labor.
Please also define any contingency plans to mitigate issues
along with any obligations you have of JEA to meet your
proposed plan.

Vendor

Total Points

15

10

10

10

Average

Gallardo Denton  Lynn Denton Gallardo Denton Lynn Gallardo Denton Lynn
Briggs Equipment Leppo, Inc | Ring Power Corporation | Southern States Toyota Lift
15 14
13 14 11 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid No Bid
4 4
5 4 4 4 No Bid No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid No Bid
10 10
10 9 8 9 No Bid No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid No Bid
10 10
10 9 7 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid No Bid
8 10
7 8 10 9 No Bid No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid No Bid
45 47 44 40 48 44
45.33333 44




Award #7 09/07/2023 Supporting Documentation

Telehandlers and Aerial Platform Evaluation

GROUP 1: CLASS 364 9000 LB FORKLIFT TELEHANDLER
Evaluation Criteria

Form, Fit and Functionality to JEA's Requirements:

Please describe how your proposed solution meets and does
not meet the technical specification submitted with this
solicitation. Please also provide information regarding your
proposed solution’s functionality and operational aspects may
and can provide value to JEA. Please fill out the below table for
each item you are submitting a bid.

Warranty:

Please provide information regarding your proposed solution’s
warranty and how JEA would be supported for warranty work if
your solution was awarded. If in excess of the specification,
please provide.

Safety Features:

Please provide information regarding your proposed solution’s
safety features from basic aspects through unique functionality
and the value it can provide to JEA. Please state those
features that are outside the specification.

Ease of Doing Business:

Please provide information regarding your post award plan to
perform to the agreement from communication plan, ease of
communication, ease of delivery, etc. that is included in your
proposal.

Proposed Delivery Date:

Please provide your anticipated delivery date along with how
this date is created relative to major components and labor.
Please also define any contingency plans to mitigate issues
along with any obligations you have of JEA to meet your
proposed plan.

Vendor

Total Points

15

10

10

10

Average

Gallardo Denton Gallardo Denton  Lynn Gallardo Denton Lynn Gallardo Denton Lynn
| Briggs Equipment | Leppo, Inc | Ring Power Corporation | Southern States Toyota Lift|
13 14 12 15
11 14 11 12 13 12 12 14
4 4 3 5
4 4 4 4 5 4 5 4
10 10 10 10
8 9 8 9 10 9 10 9
10 10 10 10
7 9 7 10 10 10 10 9
8 10 10 5
7 8| 10 8| 8 7| 10 6|
37 45 44 40 48 43 46 45 42 47 45 42
42| 43.66667| 44.3333| 44.6667|
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Telehandlers and Aerial Platform Evaluation Gallardo  Denton Lynn Gallardo  Denton Lynn Gallardo Denton Lynn Gallardo Denton Lynn
GROUP 1: CLASS 364 12000 LB FORKLIFT TELEHANDLER Vendor | Briggs Equipment | Leppo, Inc | Ring Power Corporation | Southern States Toyota Lift]
Evaluation Criteria Total Points
Form, Fit and Functionality to JEA's Requirements:

Please describe how your proposed solution meets and does

not meet the technical specification submitted with this

solicitation. Please also provide information regarding your 15 15 14 13
proposed solution’s functionality and operational aspects may
and can provide value to JEA. Please fill out the below table for
each item you are submitting a bid.

Warranty:

Please provide information regarding your proposed solution’s
warranty and how JEA would be supported for warranty work if 5 4 4 3
your solution was awarded. If in excess of the specification,
please provide. 5 4 4 4 5 4|NoBid NoBid NoBid
Safety Features:

Please provide information regarding your proposed solution’s
safety features from basic aspects through unique functionality
and the value it can provide to JEA. Please state those
features that are outside the specification.

13 14 11 12 13 14|NoBid NoBid No Bid

10 10 10 10

10 9 8 9 10 9|NoBid NoBid No Bid
Ease of Doing Business:

Please provide information regarding your post award plan to
perform to the agreement from communication plan, ease of 10 10 10 10
communication, ease of delivery, etc. that is included in your
proposal. 10 9 7 10 10 10|[No Bid NoBid No Bid
Proposed Delivery Date:

Please provide your anticipated delivery date along with how
this date is created relative to major components and labor.
Please also define any contingency plans to mitigate issues
along with any obligations you have of JEA to meet your
proposed plan. 10 8 10 8 8 9|NoBid NoBid No Bid
48 47 44 40 48 43| 46 46 46| 0

[Average 46.33333] 43.66667| 46| Ol

10 8 10 10
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Telehandlers and Aerial Platform Evaluation Vendor Gallardo Denton Lynn Gallardo Denton Lynn Gallardo Denton Lynn Gallardo Denton
GROUP 1: CLASS 371 4X4 DIESEL TELESCOPING 51' AERIAL PLATFORM Briggs Equipment | Leppo, Inc | Ring Power Corporation | Southern States T¢
Evaluation Criteria Total Points
Form, Fit and Functionality to JEA's Requirements:

Please describe how your proposed solution meets and does
not meet the technical specification submitted with this
solicitation. Please also provide information regarding your 15 14 15 13 12
proposed solution’s functionality and operational aspects may
and can provide value to JEA. Please fill out the below table for
each item you are submitting a bid.

Warranty:

Please provide information regarding your proposed solution’s
warranty and how JEA would be supported for warranty work if 5 4 4 3 5
your solution was awarded. If in excess of the specification,
please provide. 5 4 4 4 5 4 5
Safety Features:

Please provide information regarding your proposed solution’s
safety features from basic aspects through unique functionality
and the value it can provide to JEA. Please state those features
that are outside the specification.

10 10 10 10 10

Ease of Doing Business:
Please provide information regarding your post award plan to
perform to the agreement from communication plan, ease of 10 10 10 10 10
communication, ease of delivery, etc. that is included in your
proposal. 10 9 7 10 10 10 10
Proposed Delivery Date:
Please provide your anticipated delivery date along with how
this date is created relative to major components and labor.
Please also define any contingency plans to mitigate issues
along with any obligations you have of JEA to meet your
proposed plan. 7 4 10 8 8 7 10

50 45 43 40 40 48 44 46 44 44 47 44

Average 42.6667| 44| 44.6667| 44|
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Replacement Cost Quantity Actual Cost Previous Cost
Group 1 Aerial Platform 51" S 100,000 1 Have not purchased
S 85,995.00 |[in last 10 years

Group 2 Forklift Telehandler 5500 LBS S 100,000 1 S 94,177.96 |F22 $82,681.83
Group 3 Forklift Telehandler 7000 LBS S 155,000 1 S 134,180.00 |FY22 $129,417.94
Group 4 Forklift Telehandler 9000 LBS S 165,000 1 S 154,050.00 |FY12 $76,574.35
Group 5 Forklift Telehandler 12000 LBS $ 205,000 1 S 194,980.00 |FY19 (14K) $158,339
FY23/24 Total S 725,000 5 $ 663,382.96

Asset Count Budget Amount Actual Cost |
Electric Replacement 3 S 460,000.00 | $ 415,155.00
Electric Expansion 0 $ - |
Water Replacement 1 S 100,000.00 | $ 94,177.96
Water Expansion 1 S 165,000.00 | $ 154,050.00
Total 5 S 725,000.00 | $ 663,382.96
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Award #8 09/07/2023 Supporting Documentation

CAROLLO INC. - ing Services Fee (EXHIBIT I) . g
3 = 8 =
CO# 10 - Design A Permitting and Construction Phase Services E g é : § : E = 5 'g «JE 2
2 z E 2 £5 2o H g £ 5 8 8
. . . g 2 w o £8 £3 O 2 ] ) [ 5 3
Capital Ci Projects 2 e 3 3 o ga H £ S 8 §% 3 k] g3 @
g g2 H ] 52 52 2 2 g 5 Eg = 2= g £
$ g g 2 g it 5% : z 3 5 g8 z EE is £
a [ w w £0 £0 < n o« oa = =0 =< a
Loaded Rate | $ 159.00 | § 21140 § 219.17 [ $ 9230 § 219.17| $ 9230 189.80 [ $ 189.80 | § 219.17| § 113.50 | $ 76.90
TASK TASK DESCRIPTION
1 DESIGN PHASE SERVICES
Thermal Dryer System Design Design Elements 1,960 2,600 1,400 1,600 2,040 1,240 - 2,760 620 5,400 144 19,764 $3,161,064]
1.1 Incorporation of the TDDS for each of construction and reduce conflicts| 1000 1600 800 1000 0 0 0 1000 300 3000 20 $1,362,465
1.2 Process & Instrumentation Diagrams (P&IDs) for the TDDS to meet JEA Standards| 160 200 80 1600 960 [ 0 120 400 20 $597,772
1.3 Emergency Cake Loading Silo and truck loading Station Design| 160 160 60 120 [ 0 [ 400 40 400 20 $215,115
1.4 Waste Pellet Silo and Conveyor Design| 160 160 60 120 0 0 0 400 40 400 20 $215,115
1.5 Closed Loop Cooling system for Pellet Cooler| 160 160 80 120 200 80 0 160 40 400 20 $225,164
1.6 Muriatic Acid storage and feed facilities| 160 160 160 120 120 100 0 400 40 400 20 $272,562
1.7 New RSHT Ferric storage facilities| 160 160 160 120 120 100 4 400 40 400 24 $272,870
2.0 ADDITIONAL PERMITTING SERVICES 24 120 - - - - - 80 64 288 $43,186
City of Jacksonville Building Permitting Services| 0 80 0 [ 0 0 0 0 0 80 40 $29,068
FDEP Permitting Services| 24 40 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 24 $14,118
3.0 ADDITIONAL CONSTRUCTION PHASE SERVICES 95 285 590 - 430 - 40 580 - 20 125 2,165 $428,466
3.1 RPR and CEl Services Provided by C&ES Consultants Inc. See Cost below under subconsultants
3.2 Construction 1t and Support Services
3.2.1 Review Additional Shop Drawing Submittals 75 75 400 0 400 0 20 400 0 0 75 $288,600
3.2.2 Review Additional RFs| 20 50 30 [ 30 0 20 20 0 20 50 $40,607
3.2.3 Additional Site Visits and coordination with CMAR] 0 160 160 0 0 0 0 160 0 0 0 899,259 $9,975
4.0 BUCKMAN WRF YARD PIPING IMPROVEMENTS 24 40 24 - - - - - 24 40 24 176 $29,178)
Yard Piping Improvements| 24 40 24 24 40 24
Subtotal Task 2,103 3,045 2,014 1,600 2,470 1,240 40 3,340 644 5,540 357 22,393 3,661,893 $9,975 $0
Total Project Hours and Labor Costs| 2,103 3,045 2,014 1,600 2,470 1,240 40 3,340 644 5,540 357 22,393 $3,661,893 $9,975
Total Cost Per Labor Category| $ 334,377.00 | $ 643,713.00 [ § 441,408.38 | $ 147,680.00 | $ 541,349.90 [ § 114,452.00 | $ 7,592.00 | § 633,932.00 | § 141,14548 | $ 628,790.00 | $ 27,453.30 | $ - $3,661,893
Total Project Direct Expenses (Printing) $0.00
Total Travel Costs $9,975.00

TOTAL CAROLLO ENGINEERS INC.

$3,671,868.06

SUBCONSULTANTS
Construction Inspection and Architectural Services (CES Consultants Inc.) $788,760
Buckman WRF Yard Piping Improvements (Mittauer & Inc.) $441,200
Limited Structural and MEP Services (GM Hill Engineering Inc.) $41,000
SUBCONSULTANT SUBTOTAL $1,270,960.00

TOTAL LUMP SUM COSTS

$4,942,828.06




